
OVERVIEW

ROTARY DISTRICT 9815

CONFERENCE
Sponsorship Opportunities

BECAUSE WE ARE
BETTER TOGETHER

Help make positive
lasting change to
communities and

lives

28 MARCH - 30 MARCH 2025

BENDIGO, VICTORIA

https://rotary9815.org.au/sitepage/district-conference-2025



Gold Sponsor
($10,000)

Silver Sponsor
($5,000)

Bronze
($2,500)

Gala Dinner
Sponsor 

(3x $2,000)

Foundation
Breakfast
Sponsor

 (2x $2,500)

Golf
Competition

Sponsor 
(2x $2,500)

Bowls
Competition

Sponsor 
(2x $1,000)

Morning Tea at
Art Gallery

Sponsor
($1,500)

Orientation
Breakfast Sponsor

(2x $1,500)

Alumni Lunch
Sponsor 

(2x $1000)

Opening
Ceremony
Sponsor 

(2x $1,500)

Rotary Expo
Sponsor 

(3x $1000)

Speaker
Sponsor (varied
up to $3,000)

Afternoon Tea
Sponsor 

(2x $2500)

Welcome Drinks
Sponsor 

(4x $2,500)

Rotary is a global community of 1.2million business and community leaders of varying
cultures and occupations dedicated to making lasing positive change by improving
communities at the local, national and international levels.

Bringing together our passion and diverse experiences and perspectives, we exchange
ideas and take action to empower, educate and develop youth, build goodwill and
understanding between cultures, communities and countries, promote peace and resolve
conflicts, prevent and treat disease, improve sanitation, maternal and child health,
protect the environment and develop economies and communities.

The 2025 Rotary District 9815 Conference will unite 600 Rotarians, family and friends of
Rotary from the now combined districts 9810 and 9820 in Victoria.

This conference is a celebration of the dedication, service, and success of Rotary and its
members. Over the course of three days, we will showcase the impactful work of
Rotarians from across the merged districts and beyond and share insights and
achievements that highlight the spirit of Rotary. 

Please join us as we forge new connections, exchange ideas, and inspire each other to
continue making a difference in our communities and beyond. Your support, through
financial or in-kind contributions or active participation will help inspire the positive
community action we strive for. We hope you will join us in shaping the future of both
Rotary and your company.

Through the Conference and our marketing ventures your organisation could reach over
2000 individuals associated with the Rotary District 9815 and over 600 Conference
Delegates and members from the community. We have a range of sponsorship packages
available with varying benefits. 

Conference Sponsorship

Sponsorship Opportunities 



Interested in being a sponsor but the above opportunities, amounts or events are not of
interest. Please contact us and we can explore a mutually beneficial arrangement. In-
kind sponsorships are also welcome. 

Contact

Other Sponsorship Opportunities

Complimentary
Conference

Registration/s

Complimentary
Gala Dinner

Registration/s

Complimentary
Registration/s
to Sponsored

Event

Opportunity to
display

banner/s at the
Conference

Exhibition  Stall

Acknowledgment
by the MC or

Event Chair prior
to a named Event 

Opportunity to
meet sponsored

Speaker

Opportunity to
supply

promotional
material to
registrants 

Company Logo
Displayed

during breaks

Company Logo
printed on all
Conference

material

In addition to naming rights for specific events, all sponsors will have their logo
displayed on the Conference website, social media and Conference newsletters. Other
benefis will depend on sponsorship level, and may include one or more of the following:

Sponsorships Benefits


